
3 Turfway Park çAlw 5000s

1Â MILES (1:42§) STARTER ALLOWANCE. Purse $9,400 For Fillies And Mares Three Years Old And
Upward Which Have Started For A Claiming Price Of $5,000 Or Less Since August 26, 2008. Three Year Olds, 115
lbs.; Older, 122 lbs. Non-winners of a race other than Claiming at a mile or over since January 26 Allowed 3 lbs.

Coupled - Sweet Euphoria and Four Paws

Madly
Own: Jose L Lopez
Black, White Blocks, Black Cap

DE LA CRUZ F (133 17 18 19 .13) 2009: (1126 141 .13)

B. f. 4 (Mar)
Sire: Stormin Fever (Storm Cat) $5,000
Dam:Gallinaccia (Hansel)
Br: Mr & Mrs F Gill Aulick (Ky)
Tr: Lopez Jose L(15 1 2 4 .07) 2009:(83 7 .08)

L 119

Life 27 2 1 0 $31,099 61

2010 3 0 0 0 $516 35

2009 20 2 1 0 $30,006 61

TP 10 0 0 0 $2,501 46

D.Fst 9 1 1 0 $14,214 61

Wet(324) 4 1 0 0 $13,864 57
Synth 12 0 0 0 $2,501 46
Turf(290) 2 0 0 0 $520 46
Dst(334) 5 0 1 0 $6,407 59

13á10= 8TP fst 1 ú :25 :49¨ 1:15 1:40 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 34 10 7ªö 7ª 7ªö 9¦© 9¦«ö GuzmanM L119 65.60 64= 12 MisszoeyBll119É PopsLdyV119ÉWittyndWis119¨õ Broke awkward, wide 10
24â10= 1TP fst 1 ú :25 :49¦ 1:14©1:42¦ 4ÎçClm 7500N3L 35 4 3§ 2¦ 3¦ô 4ªô 5¬ô GuzmanM L118 20.00 62= 24 ìPopsLdyV118¨õ Itstimforwn118¦ö NolnLk118¦ö Bumped start, steadied 7
Placed 4th through disqualification
2â10= 2TP fst 1 ú :24¦ :49 1:15¨1:43§ 4ÎçClm 5000N3L 27 4 6¬ô 6©õ 6ª 6¬ 7¦©õ Enriquez J C L118 11.90 50= 30 Sassy Kristina118¤ô Miss Rerun115§ Misscini113ó Wide trip, no threat 8
27ã09= 1TP fst 1Â ú :25¦ :49¦ 1:14¨1:49§ 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 38 2 5§õ 5ª 5ª 6®ô 7¦© Laurente G L118 12.20e 51= 33 SweetEuphori118É HoldtheTns119¦ô WittyndWis114¦ö Well placed, no bid 10
18ã09=11TP fst 6f ú :22¦ :45§ :57©1:11 3ÎçOC 40k/N2X -N 25 2 6 6ªô 6¤ô 6¦¨ 6§¥ô Hernandez O K L118 25.80 64= 16 Kristabella119öMissing Sefa119©ö RumorControl118§ö Trailed throughout 6
5ã09= 3TP fst 1Â ú :25© :51 1:15§1:46¨ 3ÎçClm 30000(30-20)N3L 37 6 5© 3¦ô 5¨ô 6¤ 6¦¦õ Yaranga Y L118 24.40 68= 20 Winners Get Even111É SlickMiss118¦õ Poet'sEye118ô Through after half 7
22ä09= 5CD fst 6f :21© :45§ :57¦1:09¨ 3ÎçAlw 49403N2X -0 2 6 6¬ 6¦¦ 6§« 6¨« Mena M L118 55.40 53= 15 Honchis'n Ponchis120§ô Ivory Empress118§ô Diamond Song122§ô Trailed 6
25å09= 8Mnr gd 1 :24 :47© 1:12©1:39§ 3ÎçAlw 25600N3L 40 3 7¤ö 6« 7®ô 7¦¨ 7¦« Ccamaque M L117 14.40 68= 22 BrokenMint115¨ö ChelseysFan115ö BeutifulBrew117«õ Failed to compete 8
5å09= 8Mnr fst 1¬¥ :23¦ :47§ 1:13©1:46¨ 3ÎçAlw 25600N2X 59 6 7¤ô 7¤ô 6©ö 3§ô 2§õ Ccamaque M L117 33.40 71= 32 Lads Starlit115§õ Madly117Ç Pyrite Halo115É Bid gamely between 7
26æ09=10TP fst 1Â ú :23© :47 1:11§1:42© 3ÎçKyCpDstf-G3 46 4 4¬ 5® 7¦¦ 8¦¬ 8§«õ Tolentino P L114 136.60 72= 08 Indescribable122¨ô Unforgotten117ô Whirlie Bertie122ö Near rail, stopped 8
30Ý09= 9Mnr fst 6f :22 :45© :58¨1:12§ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 48 1 6 4« 3¬ 5¤ô 5¬ö Ccamaque M L116 32.10 71= 21 SterlingEmblem115ªô PolkTime115ô ImGiven115É Bump start,ins,no bid 7
10Ý09= 8Mnr sly 1 :24§ :49 1:14§1:42¦ çAlw 22400N2L 57 5 5¬ 3¨ô 3§ô 2¦ô 1¦ Ccamaque M L115 17.30 70= 30 Mdly115¦ GuiltyTresures115Ç ArrowhedPnlop112ó Angled out, up in time 7
TRAINER: Synth(53 .08 $1.51) Routes(40 .05 $1.02) J/T 2009-10 TP(1 .00 $0.00) J/T 2009-10(1 .00 $0.00)

Misszoey Belle
Own: Bill and Nick J Rennekamp
Black AndWhite Blocks, Light Blue

PRESCOTT R (132 16 11 9 .12) 2009: (1186 153 .13)

B. m. 5 (Mar)
Sire: Jambalaya Jazz (Dixieland Band) $3,500
Dam:Ransom the Belle (Red Ransom)
Br: John C Oxley (Ky)
Tr: Rennekamp Nick(16 2 2 0 .12) 2009:(130 20 .15)

L 119

Life 22 3 2 5 $48,745 72

2010 3 1 1 0 $6,850 66

2009 7 0 1 2 $3,539 61

TP 10 1 1 2 $9,722 66

D.Fst 3 0 1 0 $1,948 70

Wet(299) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Synth 15 2 1 4 $31,907 67
Turf(312) 4 1 0 1 $14,890 72
Dst(329) 7 1 0 3 $22,640 67

13á10= 8TP fst 1 ú :25 :49¨ 1:15 1:40 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 66 3 1ô 1¦ 2Ç 2Ç 1É Prescott R L119 b *3.00 81= 12 MisszoeyBelle119É PopsLdyV119ÉWittyndWis119¨õ Stiff drive, gamely 10
22â10= 7TP fst 1 ú :24¦ :48¦ 1:14¦1:41© 4ÎçClm 12000(15-10)N3L 62 1 1Ç 2Ç 2Ç 2Ç 2¦ Prescott R L115 b 12.30 71= 28 CommdoreKte113¦MisszoyBll115§ö Tlllittlscrt118¦ Dueled inside, gave in 8
3â10= 9TP fst 1Â ú :24§ :49¦ 1:15 1:48¦ 4ÎçAlw 5000s 56 4 8¦¥ 8¦¥ 7ª 7¬ 4«ö Prescott R L119 b 9.70 66= 24 Lavenham119ª This Way Home119ô Million Bells119¦õ In tight after start 8
26ã09= 9TP fst 1 ú :24© :49¨ 1:14¨1:40¨ 3ÎçClm 20000(30-20)N3L 61 9 5© 6¦ 7¨õ 7ªö 5ªõ Tolentino P L115 b 58.00 70= 33 Elliday116Ç Slick Miss118¨ö Ann's Approval119ö 6wide 1/4pole 11
3ã09= 9TP fst 1 ú :24 :48 1:13¨1:39¨ 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 52 10 9ªö 7ªô 6ªô 5« 3©ô Tolentino P L118 b 8.20 75= 16 Skilled118§ô Four Paws119§ Misszoey Belle118§ 7path 1/4, mild gain 11
20ä09= 4Beu fst 6f :22© :47§ 1:00 1:12¨ 3ÎçClm 5000N3L 44 7 6 4¨ 3§ô 3¦ 2¦ Yaranga Y L120 b *1.50 82= 17 Springinthecountry120¦ MisszoeyBelle120¨õ TrueHigh120ö Flattened out 9
4å09= 4TP fst 1 ú :23© :47¨ 1:12¨1:38§ 3ÎçClm 10000(15-10)N3L 51 3 2¦ 3ô 3¦ô 4© 5®õ Lebron V L113 b 6.80 77= 11 Sweet Gladys118É Pure Polished115ªõ Graphite Halo110ô 4 wide, tired 7
27æ09= 5TP fst 6ôf ú :22© :46¦ 1:11§1:17¨ 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 46 9 3 9ªõ 7©ô 5© 5©ö Court J K L118 b 5.80 83= 10 OneThtGotAwy117§ô Shimmry118É IncludthLdy118¦õ 4 path, nothing left 11
Previously trained by Wilkes Ian R 2008: ( 288 44 45 39 0.15 )
24â09= 8TP fst 1 ú :25§ :50¦ 1:16©1:44© 4ÎçClm 15000(15-10)N3L 47 6 3¦ô 4§ô 4¨ 3§ô 4¨ö Troilo W D L118 fb *1.20 50= 45 Bellafin118¦ô HillofVisions118ô TwoPointMker113¦ö Bid inside, flattened 8
8â09= 7TP fst 1Â ú :24§ :48© 1:15¦1:49§ 4ÎçClm 15000(15-10)N3L 58 2 3¦ô 5¨õ 3¦ô 2ô 3¨õ Troilo W D L118 fb *1.00 62= 38 ChosenVerse122¨ MissteeBlu108ÉMisszoyBll118ªô Bid 3 wide, flattened 8
27ã08= 9TP fst 1Â ú :24© :48© 1:14 1:48 3ÎçAlw 24120N1X 50 6 6¨ô 7¬ 7¬ 6¦© 6¦©ô Troilo W D L117 fb 11.10 57= 30 PrkAtDrk118ö WrEgleLdy121«ö SenoritsScrts118©ô Saved ground, evenly 11
27ä08= 7CD fst 1 :23¨ :46© 1:11¨1:37 3ÎçClm 25000 70 1 6¨ 7©õ 7ªô 6©ô 5ª Borel C H L119 fb 7.10 79= 18 Boffo120¨ö Even Tempo120Ç Thousandkissesdeep120ô Waited turn 7
TRAINER: Synth(65 .15 $1.79)WonLastStart(20 .25 $3.26) Routes(81 .16 $1.77) J/T 2009-10 TP(15 .27 $2.56) J/T 2009-10(19 .26 $2.20)

Sweet Euphoria
Own: Billy Donna and Justin Hays
Black, Lime 'Bh' And Emblem, Lime Bars

MOJICA O (47 5 8 6 .11) 2009: (1332 249 .19)

Dk. b or br f. 4 (Mar)
Sire: Broken Vow (Unbridled) $25,000
Dam:Emily's Joy (Mr. Greeley)
Br: Kenneth L Ramsey & Sarah K Ramsey (Ky)
Tr: Woodard Joe(58 11 12 8 .19) 2009:(623 194 .31)

L 119

Life 15 5 4 1 $31,103 62

2010 2 2 0 0 $9,300 59

2009 13 3 4 1 $21,803 62

TP 9 5 2 1 $26,350 62

D.Fst 2 0 1 0 $2,000 46

Wet(398) 2 0 1 0 $2,230 61
Synth 10 5 2 1 $26,738 62
Turf(301) 1 0 0 0 $135 41
Dst(351) 3 2 0 0 $9,300 62

30â10= 4TP fst 1Â ú :25¦ :50§ 1:15©1:50 4ÎçClm c-5000 59 7 5¦ö 5§ 5¨ 1Ç 1¦õ McKee J L122 b 1.90 64= 36 SweetEuphoria122¦õ LastPruner119¦õ MissFark119¦ô Loomed 5 w, cleared 8
Claimed from Ramsey, Kenneth L. and Sarah K. for $5,000, Maker Michael J Trainer 2009: ( 612 154 96 69 0.25 )
22â10=12TP fst 1 ú :23© :48 1:13©1:42¦ 4ÎçClm 5000B 58 8 8¦¦ 6¤ 4« 2§ 1§ô McKee J L122 b *1.30 70= 28 SweetEuphori122§ô SssyKristin122¦ NotMButU119ô Off slow, 5 w, cleared 11
27ã09= 1TP fst 1Â ú :25¦ :49¦ 1:14¨1:49§ 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 62 4 4ö 4§ô 3¦ô 1¦ 1É McKee J L118 b *2.20 65= 33 SweetEuphori118É HoldtheTns119¦ô WittyndWis114¦ö Steadied first turn 10
10ã09= 2TP fst 1 ú :24 :48¨ 1:14¨1:41© 3ÎçClm 5000N2L 55 7 5©ô 4É 2Ç 1¨ô 1¤ô Lenclud F¬ L110 b *.60 69= 26 SweetEuphori110¤ô DoYourABCs117¦ö MsiQun117ó Bold bid 4 w, cleared 12
8ä09= 4CD fst 1Â :24 :49¦ 1:15 1:48¦ 3ÎçClm 10000(15-10)N2L - 4 8¦¥ 5©ô 12§© - - Leparoux J R L116 b *1.60 - 24 Nolin Lake116«õ Lion Queen118ö Miss Amplified118¦õ Bled, pulled up 12
8å09= 2TP fst 1 ú :24¦ :48 1:13©1:40¨ 3ÎçClm 5000N2L 47 8 6©ô 6§ö 1Ç 2Ç 2Ç Mena M L116 b *.60 75= 22 Trust Slew118Ç Sweet Euphoria116¦õ Masai Queen116¦ö 6 wide move 12
9æ09= 4TP fst 1 ú :24§ :48¨ 1:13©1:40 3ÎçClm 5000N2L 62 9 6¨ö 4¦ô 2¦ô 2§ 2Ç Court J K L115 b *1.00 78= 24 Bubblin' Brew119Ç Sweet Euphoria115¦ö Serenity Lake118® 5 wide early 10
23Ý09= 5ElP fst 7f :22¨ :46¨ 1:12¦1:25¦ 3ÎçClm 5000N2L 46 3 9 9ªö 9¨ö 5© 2§õ Mena M L116 fb *2.10 84= 13 GeniusGovenor106§õ SwetEuphori116¦õ Bruntt118¦õ Steadied 1/4, 6 wide 12
23Û09= 1ElP myø 1 ï :23¨ :47 1:12¨1:38 3ÎçClm 7500N2L 61 5 5§õ 3§ 2§ 2¨ 2ªô Lebron V L115 b *1.30 79= 15 Courtly Miss115ªô SweetEuphoria115¬õ BettyR120©ô Bid 3 w, second best 8
1Û09= 5PID fst 1 ú :25 :49¦ 1:14 1:38¨ 3ÎçClm 15000(15-12.5)N2L 43 1 6¨ô 8§ô 7§ö 5© 5© Stokes R A III L111 b 4.60 82= 10 IsItTee117É BluesBreeze115¦õ Shegoestolvn115¦ô Shuffled back, no bid 8
17Ü09= 3CD fm 1 ê :24§ :49 1:13©1:38 çClm 40000 41 2 4§ô 4§ô 6«ô 6¦¨ 7¦©õ Leparoux J R L118 b 10.10 66= 13 KentuckyPeches118Ç BizzeeMizze118¦ô AlxndritRing118¦ö Inside, faded 7
1Ü09= 2CD myø 1 :23© :46© 1:38 çAlw 40000s 38 5 7«õ 7¤õ 7¦¦ 7¦ª 6¦®ö Bejarano R L118 b 15.20 59= 24 Multipass118© Lokomamma115¦ Full Strut118¨ô Urged off rail,wkned 7
WORKS: â16TP ú5f fst 1:02¨ B 11/23 ã5TP ú4f fst :49§ B 16/35 ä28TP ú5f fst 1:04§ B 29/36
TRAINER: 1stClaim(45 .27 $1.49) Synth(249 .23 $1.67) Routes(294 .26 $1.56) J/T 2009-10 TP(4 .00 $0.00) J/T 2009-10(11 .45 $1.53)
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This Way Home
Own: Mitchell B Marsch
White, Red Diamonds, White Cap

MCKEE J (142 30 25 13 .21) 2009: (595 67 .11)

B. m. 6 (Mar)
Sire: Wild Escapade (Wild Again) $3,500
Dam:Castle Lady (Leo Castelli)
Br: Peter M Gargan & Diane Stegall (Fla)
Tr: Gray Gary(6 1 2 1 .17) 2009:(47 7 .15)

L 119

Life 44 11 6 2 $98,236 74

2010 1 0 1 0 $1,880 59

2009 12 4 2 0 $46,340 73

TP 15 4 4 0 $33,285 74

D.Fst 20 6 2 2 $46,702 73

Wet(382) 2 1 0 0 $14,525 58
Synth 20 4 4 0 $36,245 74
Turf(186) 2 0 0 0 $764 58
Dst(345) 6 1 1 0 $14,596 65

3â10= 9TP fst 1Â ú :24§ :49¦ 1:15 1:48¦ 4ÎçAlw 5000s 59 7 5ªô 6¤ô 6¨ô 3ª 2ª McKee J L119 b 4.00 68= 24 Lavenham119ª This Way Home119ô Million Bells119¦õ 5 wide, up for place 8
23å09=10Kee fst 7f ú :22§ :45¦ 1:10 1:23¦ 3ÎçClm 25000 71 10 7 10¤õ 10«ö 6§ô 4¨ Lopez J L122 b 19.90 85= 14 Coulee120ô Sweet Gladys120§ Full of Ideas120ô Bid 6 wide, hung 10
23æ09= 4TP fst 1 ú :23¦ :47¦ 1:12¨1:39¦ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 67 5 7¦¦ 4ª 2ô 1¦ô 1§õ Lopez J L118 b 4.50 82= 19 This Way Home118§õ Nola Star120§õ Kickin N Screamin118ªõ 5 wide 3/8 pl 7
9Ý09= 3ElP fm 1 ê :24 :47§ 1:11 1:35§ 3ÎçAlw 7500s 58 7 8« 8«ö 8« 7©õ 4§ Creed B¬ L113 b 10.30 88= 06 OurTrump120ö WeddingDimond120É ApplPndowdy113¦ Late bid outside 8
1Ý09=10Hoo fst 1 :23© :47§ 1:11§1:37 3ÎçAlw 5000s 57 5 5¨ô 5¨ô 5¨ô 4ª 4ªõ Garcia J J L120 b *.80e 92= 13 Burke's Sister115ó Go Gert Go123©õ No Image123¦ 3path 1/4, no late bid 7
3Û09= 9CD fst 1 :23§ :46§ 1:10©1:37¦ 3ÎçAlw 44220N1X 73 4 2ô 1Ç 3¦ô 4©ô 5ªõ Goncalves L R L120 b 38.40 78= 16 Elizabeth Park117É Quiet Hope120¦õ Susies Gal120ó Inside, tired 9
6Þ09= 1CD fst 1Â :24¦ :48 1:13©1:47 3ÎçAlw 7500s 61 1 4§õ 3¨ô 3§ 1Ç 1É Santiago Reyes C¬ L113 b *1.50 71= 24 This Way Home113É Pish Posh120¨õ CJ'sNannie120¦¥õ Led, drifted, held 6
16Ü09= 2CD slyø 1 :24¦ :47§ 1:12©1:39© 3ÎçClm 16000 58 5 5¨õ 5©ô 4¦ö 1ô 1ô Santiago Reyes C¬ L113 b 6.30 70= 24 This WayHome113ô TequilaBound120¦ô Bellafina115Ç Bid inside, led, held 6
15ß09= 4Kee fst 1Â ú :24§ :48§ 1:12¨1:45¦ 4ÎçClm 10000 65 4 3¦ 4§ 7§õ 6§ö 4§ McKee J L118 b 8.50 80= 12 UltimtEvnt118ô TriggrFishLn118ô HlloMissLdy118¦ Lacked room, gaining 12
19à09= 2TP fst 1 ú :25© :50§ 1:15¨1:42 3ÎçAlw 5000s 62 3 4§ 4¦õ 5¦õ 4¦õ 2É McKee J L119 b *1.90 68= 32 Burke's Sister119É This Way Home119ö Hilly M119ó Rallied str, missed 6
16á09= 3TP fst 1 ú :23¨ :47¦ 1:13©1:40© 3ÎçClm 12500(12.5-10.5) 71 1 5¤ 5®ô 4© 2¨ 2¨ McKee J L118 b 6.70 71= 33 MingSling120¨ ThisWyHome118¨õ Quendom120¬ô 4 wide, steady advance 6
18â09= 4TP fst 1 ú :25¦ :50¦ 1:15©1:41© 4ÎçClm 8000(8-7) 61 9 3§ 4§ô 3¦ô 3¦ 1ó McKee J L115 b *2.20 69= 29 ThisWyHome115óWnting117ô SwtTlkinRos118¨ô Long drive 3 w,just up 9
WORKS: ã8Hpt 3f fst :38§ B 6/10
TRAINER: Synth(36 .11 $1.83) 31-60Days(12 .25 $3.02) Routes(44 .14 $1.30) J/T 2009-10 TP(21 .10 $2.11) J/T 2009-10(24 .08 $1.85)

Four Paws
Own: Billy Donna and Justin Hays
Black, Lime 'Bh' And Emblem, Lime Bars

STOKES R A III (156 30 20 18 .19) 2009: (905 115 .13)

Gr/ro. m. 5 (Apr)
Sire: Petionville (Seeking the Gold) $7,500
Dam:Forest Cat (Storm Cat)
Br: Everest Stables Inc (Ky)
Tr: Woodard Joe(58 11 12 8 .19) 2009:(623 194 .31)

L 119

Life 22 4 8 2 $119,580 78

2010 3 1 2 0 $8,300 75

2009 5 1 2 2 $13,000 67

TP 5 2 3 0 $13,760 75

D.Fst 2 0 0 2 $3,540 53

Wet(368) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Synth 10 2 5 0 $25,560 75
Turf(298) 10 2 3 0 $90,480 78
Dst(356) 0 0 0 0 $0 -

31â10= 7TP fst 1 ú :25 :49© 1:15§1:41¦ 4ÎçClm c-(8-7) 75 2 4§ 4§ô 1Ç 1© 1®ö Stanley A O L118 fb 3.20 75= 32 Four Paws118®ö No Image118É Disperse118§ Inside trip, driving 9
Claimed from Grimes William Earl for $8,000, Raley Jeffrey S Trainer 2009: ( 56 7 8 7 0.13 )
23â10= 7TP fst 5ôf ú :22§ :46¦ :59¦1:06¦ 4ÎçClm 8000(8-7) 59 4 9 8¨ö 7©ö 4© 2¦ô Stanley A O L119 fb 7.30 83= 14 Between Us119¦ô Four Paws119Ç Golden Thief118¨ö 3 wide, closed well 11
8â10= 4TP fst 6f ú :22© :47¦ 1:00¦1:14§ 4ÎçClm c-5000B 60 3 6 3§ô 2§ 2§ 2ô Yaranga Y L122 fb *1.20 67= 35 Scara Brae119ô Four Paws122§õ Skippin' Daisy114¬ Bid 2 wide, gaining 10
Claimed from Hays, Billy, Donna and Justin for $5,000, Woodard Joe Trainer 2009: ( 623 194 118 89 0.31 )
26ã09= 6TP fst 6ôf ú :22¨ :46§ 1:13¨1:20§ 3ÎçClm 5000N3L 57 2 7 8©ö 7©ö 2Ç 1¦ö Yaranga Y L119 fb *.50 74= 17 FourPws119¦ö Shimmery119¦ö TnssCoolTown118§ö Forced opening, clear 11
3ã09= 9TP fst 1 ú :24 :48 1:13¨1:39¨ 3ÎçClm 7500N3L 56 5 3¦ô 3¦ 1ô 2¦ô 2§ô Yaranga Y L119 fb *1.90 77= 16 Skilled118§ô Four Paws119§Misszoey Belle118§ Stalked, led, faltered 11
17ä09= 6Beu fst 6f :22¦ :46§ :59¦1:12¨ 3ÎçAlw 6800N1X 48 3 2 1Ç 2Ç 1Ç 3¦ô Yaranga Y L120 fb *1.70 81= 19 Triple Mandate120¦ô Nicole's Passion118Ç Four Paws120ö Weakened 7
Previously trained by Lynch Cathal 2009(as of 4/23): ( 84 14 14 16 0.17 )
23ß09= 6Atl yl 1° ê :52©1:19¦ 1:46©2:00¨ 3ÎçAlw 25000s 67 6 2§ô 2§ô 1Ç 1Ç 2¨õ Lynch F L119 fb 3.00 42= 55 SnowyElegance119¨õ FourPaws119¦ô PtsImge119¦ö Bid 3 wide, no match 8
14à09= 8Pha fst 6ôf :22§ :45§ 1:10§1:17 4ÎçClm 25000(25-20)N3L 53 2 2 5¦ô 4© 3¬ 3¦¨ Arroyo A S L118 fb 4.10 77= 20 Northernstaraglow118¤ô Spawning Brook118©ô Four Paws118¨ No threat 6
21ä08= 2Hol fst 7ôf ú :23 :46 1:10¦1:28¨ çClm c-(25-22.5) 66 6 5 5¨ 5§ö 2§ô 7¬õ Baze M C LB121 b *2.00 83= 09 Filter121ªô Snow OnChristmas121ö Dana'sBeau123É 4wd into str,no rally 8
Claimed from Everest Stables, Inc. for $25,000, Polanco Marcelo Trainer 2008(as of 11/21): ( 190 12 23 21 0.06 )
22å08= 4OSA fm 1 ê :23¦ :47¦ 1:11¨1:35 çClm 62500(62.5-55) 77 2 3§ô 3§ô 3¦ô 3§ 5§ö Baze M C LB122 b 2.80 86= 11 Lullabytime120ô Sovine120ô Lauren C120¦ö Waited bit 1/4,no bid 8
3å08= 7OSA fm 1° ê :48©1:12¨ 1:35©1:47¨ 3ÎçAlw 50200N1X 75 2 1¦ 2Ç 2¦ 4¦ô 7ª Talamo J LB118 b 13.30 85= 07 Exquisite124É Fire n' Brimstone118ô Mohaka118¦ Vied,stalked,wkened 8
15Ý08= 7Dmr fm 1 ê :22§ :47§ 1:11¨1:34¦ çSandyBlueH85k 64 1 2¦ô 4§ô 6©ô 8®ö 8¦§ Baze T C LB113 b 17.10 78= 10 SwtrStill120¦õ DwnBforDwn115Ç GorgousGoos117¦ Inside, saddle slipped 8
TRAINER: 1stClaim(45 .27 $1.49) Synth(249 .23 $1.67) Routes(294 .26 $1.56) J/T 2009-10 TP(48 .21 $1.20) J/T 2009-10(51 .22 $1.29)

Nola Star
Own: Jerry Carden
Pink And Black Quarters, Pink Bars On

CREED B (179 20 30 22 .11) 2009: (455 48 .11)

Ch. m. 6 (Apr)
Sire: Three Wonders (Storm Cat) $7,500
Dam:Mighty Action (Mighty Adversary)
Br: Hidden Point Farm Inc (Fla)
Tr: Hammond Kim(23 2 7 2 .09) 2009:(363 51 .14)

L 114ª

Life 26 7 5 5 $92,106 84

2009 17 6 3 3 $38,020 75

2007 4 0 1 1 $17,930 84

TP 8 5 1 1 $28,910 75

D.Fst 6 1 1 0 $26,540 76

Wet(310) 3 0 0 1 $6,266 62
Synth 9 5 1 2 $33,330 75
Turf(222) 8 1 3 2 $25,970 84
Dst(320) 4 0 0 1 $6,336 71

29ã09= 8TP fst 1 ú :24¦ :48 1:13¦1:40¨ 3ÎçClm c-(8-7) 67 9 1Ç 1¨ 1¨ 1¨ 1¨õ Yaranga Y L119 f *1.60 75= 33 Nola Star119¨õ Flatter Me Rose120¦ö Last Pruner117§ Pace, drew clr, drv 12
Claimed from Hays Billy for $8,000, Woodard Joe Trainer 2009(as of 12/29): ( 613 191 115 88 0.31 )
13ã09= 6TP fst 1 ú :24¦ :47© 1:13 1:39 3ÎçClm 5000 70 2 1¦ 1§ 1©ô 1« 1¬ô Ouzts PW L118 f *1.70 83= 24 Nola Star118¬ô Elle Society118ô Miss Mutak118ª Pace, drew off, drv 10
23å09= 8Beu slyø 1 :23© :47 1:13¦1:42§ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 32 1 4ª 4ª 3¨ô 4©ô 3©õ Yaranga Y L120 f *1.00 65= 22 Sundyinthesouth120ô HoustonHeist120¨ö NolStr120¦ô Improved position 4
8å09= 9TP fst 1Â ú :24 :48¦ 1:12©1:45§ 3ÎçAlw 23450N1X 59 8 1ô 1Ç 2Ç 3¨ô 4«ô Torres F C L118 f *3.70e 78= 22 KentuckyPeaches115öMillionBells119© GrpeCottge118¦ö Off inside, tired 11
23æ09= 4TP fst 1 ú :23¦ :47¦ 1:12¨1:39¦ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 63 6 2¦ô 2§ 1ô 2¦ô 2§õ Goncalves L R L120 f *1.60 80= 19 ThisWyHom118§õ NolStr120§õ KickinNScrmin118ªõ 3 wide bid, held place 7
9æ09= 7TP fst 1 ú :23¦ :46§ 1:12 1:39© 3ÎçClm 12500(12.5-10.5) 61 3 1§ô 1ª 1Ç 2§ 3§ô Yaranga Y L118 fb *1.80 76= 24 No Image111Ç Archmani118§ô Nola Star118ô Fast pace, weakened 8
Previously trained by BeardenWayne 2009(as of 8/16): ( 106 28 18 13 0.26 )
16Ý09= 4RD fm 1 ê :23© :47¨ 1:11©1:35 3ÎçClm 25000 69 1 1¦ô 1§ 1§ô 1Ç 2¨ Paucar E L122 fb *.70e 95= 07 Brave Mizz120¨ Nola Star122«õ Bellafina120§ Weakened 5
21Û09= 5RD fm 1Â ê :22¨ :46§ 1:11¦1:43§ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 60 3 2Ç 1Ç 1ô 1© 3§õ Paucar E L124 f *.40e 86= 09 Carryin the Dream120É La Rockette120§ Nola Star124§ Used up, gave way 9
7Û09= 4RD fm 1 ê :23¦ :46© 1:12 1:37 3ÎçAlw 6700N1X 64 3 1§ 1¦ô 1§ô 1¨ 1ó BushW V L121 f *.50e 88= 16 Nola Star121óMillion Bells122ö Taptobe118ö Gamely, driving 7
16Þ09= 5RD fst 1¬¥ ï :23§ :48© 1:14¦1:46 3ÎçAlw 5000s 33 5 6©ô 5¨ 5¬ 5¦¦ 5¦¤ö Ouzts PW L120 f *.90 64= 18 LeglMotion124ö SwetTlkinRos124¦¦ô ErlyHtch120¨ô Stumbled badly start 8
24Ü09= 7RD fm 1 ê :22© :46© 1:11 1:35¦ 3ÎçAlw 14400NC 74 7 1¦ô 1§ 1ô 2Ç 2¦ Ouzts PW L122 f *1.00e 96= 08 Donamour124¦ Nola Star122ªõ Ready to Rock120ô Off hedge, second best 7
25ß09= 8Ind fst 1 :23¨ :46¨ 1:12¦1:39 3ÎçAlw 5000s 48 7 2ª 2ªô 3§ 6ª 7¦¦õ Goncalves L R L123 f *.70e 77= 12 Tip Along118ö Legal Motion118ªõ Hilly M118É Off rail 1/4, no bid 8
WORKS: òá20TP ú5f fst 1:01 B 1/32 òá4TP ú4f fst :48 B 1/16 â16TP ú5f fst 1:03¦ B 17/23 ã4Hpt 4f fst :49¨ B 1/1
TRAINER: 1stClaim(7 .29 $3.91) Synth(131 .07 $0.79) 31-60Days(47 .19 $2.37) Routes(81 .15 $1.65) J/T 2009-10 TP(9 .33 $1.60) J/T 2009-10(9 .33 $1.60)

Fearful Woman
Own: Denis W Roberson Charles P Essex Dean
Red, White 'R', White Bars On Sleeves

POMPELL T L (170 28 22 23 .16) 2009: (1269 171 .13)

Dk. b or br f. 4 (Feb) OBSAPR08 $8,000
Sire: Drewman (Unbridled) $1,500
Dam:Heaven's Tear (Open Forum)
Br: Steve Tortora & Beverley Tortora (Fla)
Tr: Roberson Denis W(5 0 1 0 .00) 2009:(38 5 .13)

L 119

Life 15 4 7 1 $55,616 59

2010 1 0 1 0 $1,700 58

2009 10 4 3 1 $40,400 59

TP 2 1 1 0 $6,200 59

D.Fst 8 2 4 1 $24,858 58

Wet(283) 4 1 2 0 $24,416 39
Synth 2 1 1 0 $6,200 59
Turf(195) 1 0 0 0 $142 31
Dst(327) 4 1 3 0 $12,260 59

15â10= 9TP fst 1Â ú :26 :52¦ 1:17¦1:49¦ 4ÎçClm 8000(8-7) 58 4 4¨ 3§ 3ô 2¦ô 2¦ Pompell T L L118 4.00 67= 34 Skilled120¦ Fearful Woman118§ô Lady Seattle118¦ö 4 wide 2nd turn 8
30ã09=10TP fst 1Â ú :24¨ :49¦ 1:15 1:49¦ 3ÎçClm 5000B 59 11 10¤õ 9«ô 6¨ 1¦ 1¦ö Pompell T L L118 4.40 66= 27 Fearful Woman118¦ö Skilled122§ô Nina Nina119§õ 3 wide run 12
27ä09= 5CD fst 1 :24 :48 1:13¦1:38§ 3ÎçClm c-5000 38 9 5© 5§ 6© 7¤õ 8®ö Ocampo I L118 7.00 67= 17 EchosRsndng112ó PrncssWstly120§ NtMBtU120ªö Broke slow, bid, tired 11
Claimed from R and M Stable, Inc. for $5,000, Melton Chris Trainer 2009(as of 11/27): ( 141 24 20 19 0.17 )
14ä09= 2CD fst 1 :23¦ :47 1:12©1:38© 3ÎçClm 7500 52 10 6§õ 5©õ 4©ô 4«ô 2¬õ Arroyo E N L118 17.20 68= 22 FlatterMeRose120¬õ FearfulWoman118É YallahLeh120¦ 5 wide, late rally 11
15Ý09= 7Mnr fst 1 :24© :49¨ 1:15©1:43¨ 3ÎçClm 5000N3L 52 4 3§ 3¦ô 2Ç 1¨ 1¤õ Parker D L L115 *.30 63= 32 FrfulWomn115¤õ SintPrskvy116É TtumChpl117«ö Bid3w,duel btw,widen 7
3Ý09= 5Mnr fst 1 :24§ :48 1:13¦1:41© 3ÎçClm 5000N2L 57 7 5§ô 3ª 2© 2¦ 1«ô Parker D L L115 *1.60 72= 23 FerfulWomn115«ô InvisiblFir110§ô SwSlippry117§ö Tracked,bid3w,widened 9
24Û09= 2Mnr fst 1¬¥ :23¨ :47§ 1:13¦1:45¨ 3ÎçClm 5000N2L 51 9 8¦¥ 7®ô 3¤ 3¨ 2§ô Parker D L L115 1.90 75= 22 AlmostPrfct111§ô FrflWomn115§ SprghtlyPlsh110ô Rated bid, second best 9
3Û09= 7Ind fst 6f :22§ :45© :58¨1:12 3ÎçClm 7500N2L 40 4 7 7¬ô 6« 3© 3¨ Mojica O L115 7.10 84= 15 IdealStory118§ JustTakeIt118¦ FearfulWomn115¨ô 3path turn, some gain 7
8Þ09= 5Ind fm Í7ôf ê :25¦ :49¦ 1:14¨1:32© 3ÎçClm 15000N2L 31 3 8 8¤ô 8¬ 8¤õ 8¦¦ô Mojica O L115 2.30 61= 27 Wntrtm117¦õ LcysSltryMovs112ª Mllondollrsng115¦ö Trailed, 5path lane 8
20à09= 9Mnr fst 1 :25§ :50¦ 1:16 1:43© çAlw 24900N2L 58 5 5© 5§ 3§ 2« 2¤õ Murphy C K L115 17.10 54= 43 Rivie116¤õ Fearful Woman115§ BaskintheSun115©ô Wide bid,chase,willing 6
25â09= 7Mnr gd 1 1:19¦1:45 çMd SpWt 21k 36 3 2¦ 2¦ 1¦ 1¨ 1¤ö Murphy C K L117 *.60 56= 32 FerfulWomn117¤ö ShebsDrem117¦¨ MillRiverGl117 When ready,drew off 3
9ã08= 2Mnr my 1 :25¦ :49© 1:15©1:42© çMd SpWt 21k 39 6 5©ô 3¬ 2§ 2¤ 2ªö Parker D L L117 *.80 61= 34 GtewyLdy117ªö FerfulWomn117Ç ShebsDrm117¦ô No match, held for 2nd 9
WORKS: òá13TP ú5f fst 1:02 B 1/4
TRAINER: Synth(22 .09 $0.74) 31-60Days(8 .12 $1.35) Routes(8 .12 $1.35) J/T 2009-10 TP(12 .17 $1.35) J/T 2009-10(17 .29 $3.33)
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Lavenham
Own: Locker Racing Stables
Red, White 'Lrs' In White Diamond Frame

OUZTS PW (130 7 9 16 .05) 2009: (932 165 .18)

B. m. 5 (Mar)
Sire: Take Me Out (Cure the Blues) $3,500
Dam:Glittering Array (Stutz Blackhawk)
Br: Mr & Mrs Nelson Bunker Hunt (Ky)
Tr: Locker Timothy(5 1 1 1 .20) 2009:(13 4 .31)

L 119

Life 31 9 5 6 $88,698 72

2010 2 1 0 1 $6,670 68

2009 16 5 3 3 $46,538 72

TP 12 4 1 3 $27,578 68

D.Fst 11 3 2 1 $28,030 72

Wet(327) 5 2 2 0 $29,280 66
Synth 15 4 1 5 $31,388 68
Turf(210) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Dst(299) 1 1 0 0 $5,640 68

12á10=11TP fst 1 ú :24 :48 1:13©1:41¦ 3ÎçAlw 21690N1X 57 2 1¦ô 1¦ 1¦ô 1ô 3ªô Ouzts PW L118 6.90 69= 22 DeputyDarling118§õ WinnersGetEven118¨õ Lavenhm118§ Off inside, tired 10
3â10= 9TP fst 1Â ú :24§ :49¦ 1:15 1:48¦ 4ÎçAlw 5000s 68 2 1¦ô 1¦ 1¦ 1¨ô 1ª Ouzts PW L119 6.30 73= 24 Lavenham119ª This Way Home119ô Million Bells119¦õ Drifted out late 8
5ã09= 9TP fst 6f ú :22§ :45¨ :57©1:10 3ÎçAlw 21640N1X 65 4 2 7¨õ 5©ö 6ªõ 5¬õ Mena M L118 6.50 83= 11 SilverTime117¦õ VegasWedding119¦ö SweetGldys118¨ô 4path turn, no threat 9
18ä09= 8CD gd 6f :22¦ :46 :59§1:12§ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 66 3 7 6¨ 6¦õ 2ô 1§ Mena M L119 6.30 75= 18 Lavenham119§ Sister Odell119¦ Jones Time119¦õ Well handled, cleared 10
28å09= 5Kee fst 7f ú :23¨ :47§ 1:12 1:24¦ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 61 1 5 1¦ô 1Ç 3¦ô 3©õ Mena M L122 5.00 79= 14 MilwaukeeQueen120©õ Blizzardconditions120Ç Lvenhm122Ç Inside, tired 12
24æ09= 3TP fst 5ôf ú :21¨ :45¦ :57©1:04¨ 3ÎçAlw 5000s 67 4 1 5¨ô 4§ô 2¦ô 2É Ouzts PW L122 1.60 93= 12 FormalDannie120É Lavenham122© SouthernSweetTe112¦ô 4 wide run turn 5
30Ý09= 7RD fst 5ôf :22© :46 :59 1:05§ 3ÎçAlw 6700N1X 72 1 1 2§ 2§ 2Ç 1É Ouzts PW L122 3.30 95= 15 Lavenham122É NewportLulu120¤ JamiesMmbo120ö Wore down rival late 6
14Ý09=11RD fst 6f :22 :45¦ :58¦1:12 3ÎçAlw 6700N1X 54 3 5 4§ô 3¦ô 3§ 4§ö Ouzts PW L124 *.60 88= 13 CarolinaTripper120ö ScaraBrae120ô Tapitsdontlie119¦ô 3wide move, empty 7
24Û09= 9RD fst 6f :22 :45¦ :58 1:12 3ÎçAlw 5000s 65 4 5 5¦ö 5§ô 2ô 1¨ô Ouzts PW L122 2.00 91= 11 Lvenhm122¨ô NwportLulu124¨õ GoldChrysnthmum120Ç Outside, driving 6
14Þ09= 8CD fst 6f :21© :45¦ :57§1:09© 3ÎçAlw 7500s 66 3 10 9ªõ 9« 8« 4®ô Leparoux J R L119 5.20 78= 14 Gatorize119© Rose Run123¨õ Jones Time121§õ Stumbled start 10
29Ü09= 1CD fst 5ôf :22© :46§ :58¨1:04§ 3ÎçClm 10000 69 2 3 5§ö 4§ 2ô 1¨õ Mena M L120 4.70 92= 12 Lavenham120¨õ Pros N Cons120¨ Tapitsdontlie117¦ö Inside trip, driving 6
14Ü09= 1CD slyø 1 :24 :47§ 1:13 1:40¦ 3ÎçClm c-7500 58 5 1§ 1§ 1Ç 1Ç 2¦ Hernandez B J Jr L120 *1.30 67= 28 C J's Nannie122¦ Lavenham120ö Suntantoes122¨ö Inside, outfinished 6
Claimed from Roberson, Denis W., Essex, Charles P., South, WilliamM., and Maiden, Rodney for $7,500, Roberson Denis W Trainer 2009(as of 5/14): ( 14 1 1 4 0.07 )
TRAINER: Synth(11 .09 $1.33) Routes(3 .33 $4.87) J/T 2009-10 TP(4 .25 $3.65) J/T 2009-10(7 .43 $4.17)
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